

Ref No. SG8302

Date: 8 July 2019

REQUEST:

- 1) The number of people seen by adult Mental Health Services in the latest year for which you have complete data, by ethnicity (specify which year please). If possible, please break this down further by gender and age.
- 2) The number of people seen by adult Mental Health Services in the latest year for which you have complete data, by nationality. If possible, please break this down by gender and age.
- 3) The number of people seen by adult Mental Health Services in the latest year for which you have complete data, by country of birth. If possible, please break this down by gender and age.
- 4) [If not provided an answers to Qs 1-3] the number of times Polish people used your Adult Mental Health Services in the latest year for which you have data? If possible, please break this down by gender and age.
- 5) The number of times a Polish interpreter was used within adult mental health services in the past year
- 6) The number of people for whom the Mental Health Act was used in the past year, broken down by Ethnicity, Nationality and/or Country of Birth
- 7) The number of times the four most frequently used psychiatric diagnoses were used in the past year, broken down by Ethnicity, Nationality and/or Country of Birth
- 8) The number of people that received psychological therapies in the past year, broken down by Ethnicity, Nationality and/or Country of Birth
- 9) Does your trust have a policy, programme or initiative that focuses on ethnicity/diversity/cultural competence/race inequality relating to:
 - a. The provision of adult mental health services?
 - b. Operational aspects of mental health services e.g. staffing / recruitment / support?
- 10) If yes, please include the policy/policies in your response.*
- 11) What number of adult Polish people are in your catchment area?
- 12) What is the adult population of your catchment area?

OUR RESPONSE:

- 1) 2), 4) 6), 7) and 8). Please see attached Excel spreadsheet.
- 3) Unfortunately, we do not hold this information as Country of Birth is not captured.
- 5) 71
- 9) & 10) Please see attached the Trust's Diversity and Inclusion Policy.
- 11) & 12) Unfortunately, we do not hold this information, but believe the local councils may be able to provide this information. They can be contacted at:
Leicester City Council:
<https://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/how-we-work/data-protection-and-foia/freedom-of-information/>
Leicestershire County Council:
<https://www.leicestershire.gov.uk/about-the-council/freedom-of-information/freedom-of-information-requests>

Attachments: