Ref No. SG9254

Date: 9 March 2020

REQUEST:
1. The total number of patients discharged from an acute hospital setting between January 2017 -
January 2020 with one or more of the following Admission Characteristics:

Female

Aged 18+

Personality Disorder

Complex Mental Health Needs

Challenging Behaviour

Significant Comorbidity

Historic Substance Misuse

Traumatic Histories

Significant Previous Management Problems
Contact with Criminal Justice System

2. A summary breakdown of which services the patients were referred to with particular reference to the
following:

a) Another NHS Rehabilitation Facility
b) Independent Sector Facility

¢) Supported Living Scheme

d) Other Community Service

Please could you include the name and geographical location of the service referred too?

3. A further breakdown of the number of Out of Area Placements made between January 2017 and
January 2020 of patients with the same admission characteristics as those detailed in Question 1 with
particular reference to the following:

a) The name and geographical location of the service referred too?
b) What was the total cost of out of area placements to the Trust from January 2017 to January 2020?

OUR RESPONSE: From our preliminary assessment, we estimate that compliance with your request
would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 of the Freedom of information Act 2000,
currently £450, as we do not centrally record some of the information being requested at 1 above and
would need to check every patient’s record to locate and retrieve the information. However, rather than
refusing your request in its entirety we are providing information where it is reasonable to do so.

1 and 2. The following tables show all discharges with diagnosis codes F60.9 - Personality Disorder and
Z86.4 - Historic Substance Misuse between January 2017 and January 2020 for females aged 18 and
above. Please note: Unfortunately, we do not hold location details.

Personality Disorder

Discharge Destination Total

Local Authority residential accommodation i.e. where care is provided
NHS other hospital provider — (Mental Health or LD)

Non-NHS (other than Local Authority) run Care Home

Non-NHS run hospital

Temporary place of residence

Usual place of residence
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Not recorded
Grand Total 13




Historic Substance Misuse
Discharge Destination Total
Local Authority residential accommodation i.e. where care is provided 3
NHS other hospital provider — (Mental Health or LD) 1
Non-NHS (other than Local Authority) run Care Home 2
Non-NHS run hospital 4
Non-NHS run hospital — medium secure unit 2
Temporary place of residence 7
Usual place of residence 82
Not recorded 45
Grand Total 146

3. Unfortunately, we do not hold this information. East Leicestershire and Rutland CCG commission out
of area beds and may hold the information you require. They can be contacted at:
http://www.eastleicestershireandrutlandccg.nhs.uk/foi



http://www.eastleicestershireandrutlandccg.nhs.uk/foi

