	Ref No.: FOI/2526/SG16939

	Date FOI request received: 17th July 2025

	Date FOI response: 8th August 2025

	REQUEST & OUR RESPONSE:  
I am writing to make an open government request for all the information to which I am entitled under the FOI Act 2000.

Can you please provide an update on your Trust’s Infrastructure, including aspects of SaaS, Messaging, and eProcurement? The questions are in the attached spreadsheet, which I would be grateful if you could fill in.

OUR RESPONSE: Please see attached spreadsheet.



	ATTACHMENT:


[image: image1.emf]FOI-2526-SG16939-

Response_FINAL.xlsx




Template

				FOI 2526-SG16939

				1. Do you currently use any Software-as-a-Service (SaaS) ? Do you plan to over the next 2 years?		Yes/No		If yes, preferred supplier		Additional notes

						No		N/A		N/A



				2: For each element detailed below, how does your organisation manage its data storage? 		On Premises / Off Premises		Main supplier		Annual spend 2024/2025 [£]		Contract end date		Additional notes

				In-house data centre		On Premises		Dell		Included in £150k overall spend		N/A		N/A

				DEFINITION: Physical or virtual servers that are connected internally and externally through networking and communication equipment to store, transfer and access digital information

				Data Storage Management		On Premises		Dell		Included in £150k overall spend		N/A		N/A

				DEFINITION: The management of various data storage methods used in the Trust

				Other (please specify)



				3: Which internal (staff) messaging system does your organisation use?		Main provider		Product version		% Accounted for overall by this method		Contract end date		Additional notes

				WhatsApp		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A

				Signal		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A

				SMS		Yes		Vodafone		Information not held		1/30/28		N/A

				Teams		Yes		Microsoft		Information not held		National NHS Agreement. NHS England will hold this information.  Contact details about how to make an FOI request to them can be found at: 
https://www.england.nhs.uk/contact-us/foi/		N/A

				Multidisciplinary team (MDT) groups		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A

				Other (e.g. pagers; please specify)		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A



				4: Which external (for Patients/Outpatients) messaging system does your organisation use? 		Main provider		Product version		% Accounted for overall by this method		Contract end date		Additional notes

				WhatsApp		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A

				Signal		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A

				SMS		Yes		Vodafone		Information not held		1/30/28		N/A

				Teams		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A

				Apps		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A

				Other (please specify)		Yes		TPP SystmOne		Information not held		Mar-27		N/A



				5: Do you currently have a remote monitoring solution?		Yes/No		Device Types [Please List]		Number of devices		Main suppliers [please list]		Total annual spend 2024/2025 [£]		Contract end date		Additional notes

				DEFINITION: Technology to monitor certain aspects of a patient's health outside of a traditional care setting. E.g. Monitors for blood levels, cardiology, insulin, blood pressure, heart rate etc		Yes		Tablets and patients own devices.		57		Spirit Health		175,000		Nov-25		N/A



				6: If your organisation does not currently have remote monitoring solutions, are you planning to implement any within the next two years?		Yes/No		Preferred Supplier		Expected types		Additional notes

				Where you plan to implement new remote monitoring solutions, please provide details as requested		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A



				7: Does your trust have a database management supplier?		Software name		Main Supplier		Total annual spend 2024/2025 [£]		Contract end date		Additional notes

				DEFINITION: Database Management Systems (DBMS) are software systems used to store, retrieve, and run queries on data. A DBMS serves as an interface between an end-user and a database, allowing users to create, read, update, and delete data in the database.		SQL Server		Microsoft		£17,000		Jan-33		RDMS



				8 Does your trust have data mining suppliers?		Software name		Main Supplier		Total annual spend 2024/2025 [£]		Contract end date		Additional notes

				DEFINITION: Data Mining Software helps users analyze data from different databases and detect patterns. Data mining tools aim to find, extract, and refine data and then distribute the information.		No		N/A		N/A		N/A		N/A



				9a.  Do you currently use any eprocurement software?		Software name		Main provider		Total annual spend 2024/2025 [£]		Contract end date		Additional notes

				DEFINITION: eProcurement is the use of software systems that help you with procurement activities, where the 'e' stands for electronic. It is a business software that automates the procurement process, from sourcing and vendor selection to purchase order creation and payment processing. It helps with supplier management, spend management/analysis, contract management, and compliance in procurement operations.		Atamis and Oracle 		Salesforce and Version1 		This information isn't held. The financial module is one of many modules used so it's impossible to split the cost. 		Atamis is a National System provided to all NHS Organisations. Oracle 23/10/2025		N/A

				9b. Of the modules you have purchased with this software, which are you actively using?  		Please list		Additional notes

						Atamis - Not purchased as separate modules. 		N/A

						Oracle - Purchasing, iProc. 

				9c. If you do not use any eprocurement software, do you plan to over the next 2 years?		Yes/No		Supplier name		Additional notes

				N/A





Model Answers

				MODEL ANSWERS



				1. Do you currently use any Software-as-a-Service (SaaS) ? Do you plan to over the next 2 years?		Yes/No		If yes, preferred supplier		Contract end date		Additional notes

				DEFINITION: Software as a service (SaaS) is a software distribution model in which a cloud provider hosts applications and makes them available to end users over the internet.		Yes		AWS		9/23/26



				2: For each element detailed below, how does your organisation manage its data storage? 		On Premises / Off Premises		Main supplier		Annual spend 2024/2025 [£]		Contract end date		Additional notes

				In-house data centre		On premise		Microsoft		£335,000		5/30/28

				DEFINITION: Physical or virtual servers that are connected internally and externally through networking and communication equipment to store, transfer and access digital information

				Data Storage Management		On premise		Nutanix		£41,215		Out of contract		Currently out to tender

				DEFINITION: The management of various data storage methods used in the Trust

				Other (please specify)



				3: Which internal (staff) messaging system does your organisation use?		Yes/No		Main supplier		% Accounted for overall by this method		Contract end date		Additional notes

				WhatsApp		n/a				0

				Signal		No				0

				SMS		Yes		EE		72%		9/1/27

				Teams		Yes		Microsoft		28%		3/31/30

				Other (e.g. pagers; please specify) Pagers		Yes		Multitone Bleep		89%		8/23/29



				4: Which external (for Patients/Outpatients) messaging system does your organisation use? 		Yes/No		Main supplier		% Accounted for overall by this method		Contract end date		Additional notes

				WhatsApp		n/a

				Signal		n/a

				SMS		Yes		Virgin		99%		12/22/25

				Teams		n/a				0

				Apps

				Other (please specify)		Yes		TPP SystmOne		55%		6/21/29



				5: Do you currently have a remote monitoring solution?		Yes/No		Device Types [Please List]		Number of devices		Main suppliers [please list]		Total annual spend 2024/2025 [£]		Contract end date		Additional notes

				DEFINITION: Technology to monitor certain aspects of a patient's health outside of a traditional care setting. E.g. Monitors for blood levels, cardiology, insulin, blood pressure, heart rate etc		Yes		Insulin Pumps & Pens / Blood Glucose Monitors / Cardiac Devices / Home monitoring		1000+		Abbott / Boston Scientific / Medtronic / Docobo		Abbott £45,000 / Boston £465,878 / Medtronic £231,555 / Docobo £41,323		Abbott 31/03/2026 / Boston 23/10/2021 / Medtronic 11/11/2025 / Docobo 05/07/2029



				6: If your organisation does not currently have remote monitoring solutions, are you planning to implement any within the next two years?		Yes/No		Preferred Supplier		Expected types		Additional notes

				Where you plan to implement new remote monitoring solutions, please provide details as requested		n/a



				7: Does your trust have a database management supplier?		Software name		Main Supplier		Total annual spend 2024/2025 [£]		Contract end date		Additional notes

				DEFINITION: Database Management Systems (DBMS) are software systems used to store, retrieve, and run queries on data. A DBMS serves as an interface between an end-user and a database, allowing users to create, read, update, and delete data in the database.		Oracle Database / Oracle Enterprise Manager		Oracle		£321,987		3/31/28



				8. Does your trust have data mining suppliers?		Software name		Main Supplier		Total annual spend 2024/2025 [£]		Contract end date		Additional notes

				DEFINITION: Data Mining Software helps users analyze data from different databases and detect patterns. Data mining tools aim to find, extract, and refine data and then distribute the information.		Designer Cloud		Alteryx		£25,434		8/30/25



				9a.  Do you currently use any eprocurement software?		Software name		Main provider		Total annual spend 2024/2025 [£]		Contract end date		Additional notes

				DEFINITION: eProcurement is the use of software systems that help you with procurement activities, where the 'e' stands for electronic. It is a business software that automates the procurement process, from sourcing and vendor selection to purchase order creation and payment processing. It helps with supplier management, spend management/analysis, contract management, and compliance in procurement operations.				Mercell		£113,451		3/12/29

				9b. Of the modules/tools you have purchased with this software, which are you actively using?  		Please list		Additional notes

						E-sourcing / E-tendering

				9c. If you do not use any eprocurement software, do you plan to over the next 2 years?		Yes/No		Supplier name		Additional notes

						n/a






