	Ref No.: FOI/2526/SG17062

	Date FOI request received: 6th August 2025

	Date FOI response: 13th  August 2025

	REQUEST & OUR RESPONSE:  
1. Please state which police force/s serve the area covered by the Trust 

OUR RESPONSE: Leicestershire Police

2. Any reports, assessments or data – internal or published – where the Trust has monitored the implementation and impact of Right Care, Right Person by the local police force/s

OUR RESPONSE: We do not hold this information.

3. Details of any serious incidents or patient safety incidents where Right Care, Right Person was a factor

OUR RESPONSE: We do not hold this information.




