	Ref No.: FOI/2526/SG18146

	Date FOI request received: 26 February 2026

	Date FOI response: 13 March 2026

	REQUEST & RESPONSE: I am writing to request information under the Freedom of Information (FoI) Act 2000. This FoI request is part of a research study conducted by the University of Manchester. Our study aims to investigate the availability of liaison psychiatry services for patients presenting with a condition called Functional Neurological Disorder (FND).

FoI questions:
 

1. Does the liaison psychiatry service accept referrals for patients diagnosed with suspected or confirmed Functional Neurological Disorder (FND)?

a. No

b. Yes

OUR RESPONSE: Yes.
2. Are there formal exclusion criteria that would prevent patients with FND from being assessed by liaison psychiatry?

a. No

b. Yes

i. What are the criteria?

OUR RESPONSE: No.
3. Are there inclusion criteria within FND?

a. No

b. Yes

i. What are the criteria?

OUR RESPONSE: No.
4. Where are patients with FND assessed?

a. Inpatient wards

b. Emergency departments

c. Outpatient settings

d. A mixture, please detail:

e. Not assessed at all

OUR RESPONSE: A mixture -wherever they are based at the LRI – usually on the ward but patients can be seen in the Emergency Department if required.
5. Is there a standardised assessment tool you use for patients with suspected or confirmed FND?

a. No

b. Yes

OUR RESPONSE: No.
6. Do you have a policy, guideline or dedicated pathway for patients with suspected or confirmed FND?

a. No

b. Yes

OUR RESPONSE: No.
7. Between January 2024-December 2025, how many patients with a suspected or confirmed FND were referred to liaison psychiatry? *

a.  

b. Data not held

OUR RESPONSE: B. From our preliminary assessment, we estimate that compliance with your request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 of the Freedom of information Act 2000, currently £450, as we do not centrally record the information being requested and this would require a manual review of patient records to determine.  
8. Between January 2024-December 2025, how many patients with a suspected or confirmed FND were accepted by liaison psychiatry? *

a.  

b. Data not held

OUR RESPONSE: Please refer to our response to question 7 above.
9. If FND patients are not seen by the liaison psychiatry team, are they referred to other services for assessment of their mental health?

OUR RESPONSE: The patient would be referred to MHLS if they had a mental health need to be reviewed but, if they are not referred to MHLS then, UHL would make their own plan and MHLS would not be involved.
10. Does the liaison psychiatry unit provide training to its staff on FND? If yes, please specify.

a. No

b. Yes

i. Please specify:

OUR RESPONSE: No.
11. Is your liaison psychiatry service commissioned to see patients with FND?

OUR RESPONSE: Yes, if there is a mental health need. 

* Alternative codes for FND: psychogenic, conversion, stress-induced, functional, pseudoseizure, dissociative, non-organic, psychosomatic, hysterical, psychological cause.



